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(Handwritten:  Monday, April 16, 1934)  

   Raymond Beer, son of Mr. and Mrs. C. C. Beer of this place, is employed at the Globe Hatchery at the 
present.  

   Miss Agnes Mettler, R. N., of Kendallville, came to Berne Friday to attend the Alpha-Arena contest and visit 
relatives and friends.  She returned to Kendallville Sunday.  

   Miss Vesta Rich, Latin instructor in the Monroe High School, and Harvey Habegger, Junior in the Monroe 
High School, returned from Bloomington Saturday afternoon where Harvey participated in the finals of the state 
Latin contest.  Miss Dorcas Petty, Jefferson high school teacher and Miss Clara Gabel, Jefferson school student, 
also attended the contest and returned home Saturday.  

*****  

(Handwritten:  May 2, 1934) 

BLUFFTON MAYOR DIES  

   Funeral rites for John W. Kelly, Bluffton mayor, who died Monday, will be held at 9:30 a.m. Thursday at St. 
Joseph's Catholic Church.  Burial will be in Fairview Cemetery.  City offices and business places will be closed 
during the services. 

   The city council Tuesday night elected G. T. Markley, oldest member of the council, as mayor pro-tem, to 
serve until May 15, when a permanent mayor will be elected by the body.  

*****  

(Handwritten:  Thursday, May 3, 1934)  

LUETTA HUSER IS MARRIED 

Granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jacob Huser Weds Recently  

   Miss Luetta Huser, sophomore at Celina high school, and Tod Faller, also of Celina, motored to Auburn, Ind., 
Friday morning and were married April 20, by James L. Griffin, J. P. of Auburn. 

   Miss Huser, now Mrs. Faller, is a granddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jacob Huser of Berne and has many 
relatives here. 

   Miss Huser had motored to school with her brother, Gerald, and was joined there by young Faller and with 
him motored to Auburn where the ceremony was performed.  Their marriage was a complete surprise to Miss 
Huser's parents. 

   Mr. and Mrs. Faller on their return to Celina went to the home of his parents, Mr. and Mrs. A. B. Faller, where 
they will make their home for the present. 



   Miss Huser is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Levi Huser, who reside just north of Celina.  The groom is a 
graduate of Celina high school of the class of 1931, and is employed at the Brandt chair factory.  

*****  

(Handwritten:  Thursday, May 10, 1934)  

LAST ISSUE OF BUDGET DEDICATED TO MISS RUTTER WHO RESIGNS POSITION  

   In this issue of the Review appears the last issue of the Budget, Berne high school publication for the present 
year.  The last issue of the Budget is being dedicated to Miss Dorothy Rutter, who has been a member of the 
Berne high school faculty for the past two years.  Miss Rutter resigned her position this week, and consequently 
will not be back on the faculty next year, leaving a vacancy which will probably be filled soon. 

   Miss Rutter came to Berne in the fall of 1932, succeeding Miss Evelyn Goff, now Mrs. Horace Abbot.  She 
teaches English and Latin here.  Her home is in Rosedale, Indiana.  She received her A. B. degree from Depauw 
in 1930.  During her two years in Berne she has made many friends who will regret to see her leave, but wish 
her success in the future.  

***** 

(Handwritten:  Monday, April 16, 1934)  

HABEGGER BUYS RESTAURANT 

Louis Habegger New Owner of West Main Restaurant and Cream Station  

   Louis Habegger, local produce dealer, has purchased the West Main Restaurant and Schlosser's Cream 
Station  from John F. Mazelin, it was announced today.  The deal was completed the latter part of last 
week.  Mr. Habegger will retain Mr. Mazelin to run the place, it is understood. 

   Mr. Habegger, who operates a huckster wagon part time plans to carry a line of groceries in his new business 
place, besides operating the restaurant and cream station. 

   Mr. Mazelin has operated the cream station for a number of years and several months ago started his 
restaurant on West Main street where Dad's Place was formerly located.    

***** 
(Handwritten:  Monday, April 16, 1934)  

   Eli W. Habegger, 16, son of Mr. and Mrs. Jacob H. Habegger of Monroe township, underwent an operation 
for the removal of his appendix at the Adams County Memorial hospital Sunday.  

   It is reported that eleven members of the John J. Schwartz, Jr., family of near Monroe are confined to their 
beds with the measles.  It is estimated that there are nearly a thousand cases of measles in the south half of the 
county.  

   William Habegger, 14, son of Mr. and Mrs. Joseph P. Habegger of near Monroe is suffering with pneumonia. 



***** 
 
(Handwritten:  Thursday, April 12, 1934)  

LOCAL BARBER ILL 

   Marcus Lehman, local barber, is ill with a case of lobar pneumonia.  Mr. Lehman complained of not feeling 
well Monday and went home at noon.  By Tuesday morning pneumonia had developed.  His condition today 
was reported as good.  

QUIT RETAIL ROUTE 

   The City Bakery here has discontinued its retail bread route, effective last Tuesday.  The route was covered by 
Virgil Kelly of Geneva.  Hugo Beitler is driving a wholesale truck for the local bakery.  The retail route was 
operated for several years.  

*****  

(Handwritten:  Thursday, May 10, 1934)  

   Raymond Mazel is going to be very busy after school is out.  He is going - but his poem tells us all about it. 

   "Spring is here again,      So I will go to Uncle Ben 

     I will work to earn        And I will work to learn. 

     This is the way to do     All spring through." 
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